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PRESS RELEASE 

 
HYGEIA S.A.: FREE AMBULANCE DONATION TO THE MUNICIPALITY 

OF MAROUSSI 

With great success was completed the ceremony of delivery of the ambulance of 
the Diagnostic and Therapeutic Center of Athens YGEIA to the Municipality of 
Marousi.   
 
The ambulance is fully equipped based on EKAV specifications and is 
immediately available to the citizens of the municipality of Marousi.  
 
The ceremony was completed in the presence of the Vice-President of the Board 
of Directors of “YGEIA”, Mr. Themistocles Xaramis, the CEO Mr. Pasxalis 
Bouxouris, the Private Banking Manager of Marfin Bank Mr. Alexis Komninos 
and many members of the Executive Council of the Municipality of Marousi 
and citizens of the municipality.  
 
The Mayor of Marousi, Mr. Georgios Patoulis thanked the Management of 
YGEIA and stressed that it is an honor for the citizens to be offered such a unit 
for transporting patients.   
 
On his side, the Vice-President of the BD of “YGEIA” Mr. Themistocles Xaramis 
underlined that the offer took place within the scope of the effort of the Mayor 
and the Executive Council for the upgrade of health services of the Municipality 
toward the residents, as well as of the Program of Social Responsibility of the 
Hospital.  
 
He also assured the Mayor that YGEIA will be an aid in every similar effort. He 
also took the opportunity to request the contribution of the Municipality in the 
acceleration of the procedures of creating a pedestrian bridge in front of the 
building of “YGEIA”, on Kifisias Boulevard, in order to prevent serious 
accidents due to the increased traffic in the area.   
 
Mr. Patoulis responded positively to the proposal of Mr. Xaramis and 
committed to moving the procedures along for the study design, granting of the 
permit and the construction of the pedestrian bridge at the most dangerous 
point of Kifisias Boulevard.   

  


